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MOTIVATION
The quality of health information 
is strongly influenced by the ability 
of capturing and maintaining data 
semantics at the time of 
generation.

APPROACH
openEHR addresses these issues 
with: 

● multi-level modelling, to collect 
clinical information with a 
computable and ontological 
semantic approach, regardless 
of specific software 
implementations;

● a wide community creating and 
managing a broad library of 
clinical knowledge artefacts 
(archetypes and templates), 
including models for genomic 
information.

RESULTS
● We implemented a system for 

the modelling, management and 
interexchange of biomedical 
data, leveraging openEHR, 
Phenopacket and HL7-FHIR.

● We represented the 
Phenopacket data schema as 
openEHR archetypes for the 
purposes of integration.

● We are testing the system with a 
synthetic dataset.

● Future works include the use 
with real datasets in the rare 
disease and cancer domains.
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